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GEORGETOWN-SCOTT COUNTY

Dear Board Member,

Fax: (502) 867-3710

The monthly meeting of the Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation
Board will be held on April 17, 2023, at 5:30 pm at the Pavilion, 140 Pavilion
Drive Georgetown KY.

Several important topics will be discussed so your attendance is greatly

appreciated.

ly,

Sincere

Vicki Miller
Office Manager
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Board Meeting

AGENDA
April 17, 2023

The monthly meeting of the Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation Board will be held on April 17,
2023, at 5:30 pm at the Pavilion, 140 Pavilion Drive, Georgetown KY.

1) Call to Order and Roll Call

2) Approval of Agenda

3) Public Comments

4) Consent Agenda
1. Approval of the minutes for the March 20, 2023, Board Meeting
2. Bills for Approval

5) Staff Reports

Bookkeepers Report — Vicki Miller

Assistant Directors Report — Ed Maynard

Facilities Maintenance — Mike Short

Outdoor Maintenance — Larry Brandenburg

. Directors Report- Kim Rice

d Business

Twisted Fixin’s Suffoletta Contract- Bryan Parker

FFA Rental Rate- Kim Rice

AED’s-Bryan Parker

Auditor Contract- Kim Rice

GSC FOTP Sonya Ducett- Scott Ducett

ew Business

. Discipline Appeal-Ms. Broussard

. Softball Club Appeal-Mrs Marcinko, Mrs Kuhn

. Georgetown Force Volleyball

. Update to Polices POL.P.01.02 through POL.P.01.09-Kim Rice

. Marketing Report-Courtlyn Ledesma

. Chemical Bid- Bryan Parker

. Cabanas -Bryan Parker

. Secretary of GSC Parks Board- Dt Wells

. Claims Awareness- Kim Rice

6)

orwnrQuswne

7)

=2

O N AR W =

8) Board Member’s Comments
9) Adjournment



Georgetown Scott County Parks and Recreation
Special Board
Minutes

March 20, 2023

1) Call to Order and Roll Call: Ron Flannery called the March 20, 2023, meeting of the
Parks and Recreation Board to order. Board Members present were Sharon Flynt,
Michael Johnson, Marlin McKay, Dale Stowe, Bill Hamilton, and DT Wells. Others
present are Kim Rice, Bryan Parker, Ednal Maynard, Vicki Miller, Helen Tobin, Ben
Willis, Katie Posey, Courtlyn Ledesma, Tina Lilly, Mike Short, Levone Hays, Spencer
Mahon, Patricia Harmond, Shar Golding, Roy Tudor, Ann Harmond, Sonja Brent,
Christine Anglin, Skyler Denham, Rachel Ferguson, Hitesh Basher.

2) Approval of Agenda: Kim Rice made corrections moving Archery to number one on
new business and executive session is number seventeen on the agenda not sixteen.
Dale Stowe made a motion to approve the agenda seconded by Bill Hamilton. The
motion carried unanimously.

3) Public Comments: Leandre Hays addressed the board about the skate park and the
safety concerns of the structure. The board invited Mr. Hays to come back the next
day to point out the specific safety issues for us to repair. Kim Rice reminded the
board that a quote had been given in the past to concrete the area and it added to
approximately 400,000.00 dollars broken down into three phases.

4) Consent Agenda items

1. Approval of minutes-Bill Hamilton made a motion to approve February 20, 2023,
seconded by Michael Johnson. The motion carried unanimously.

2. Bills for Approval-Bill Hamilton approved the bills as presented and seconded by
Dale Stowe. The motion carried unanimously.

5) Staff Reports

1. Bookkeepers Report — Vicki Miller informed the board that we currently have
1,886,685.68 versus 1,238,821.60 this time last year and financial statements
were handed out.

2. Assistant Directors Report- Ed Maynard informed the board that the Pavilion’s
February attendance was 17,754. Ed Davis’s February attendance was 696.

3. Facilities Maintenance Report Mike Short let the board know that the pool
heaters are in and operating and the roof units are still scheduled to be in this
month. The outdoor pool tile work is done but the weather is still too cold to
move forward with other projects at the pool.

4. Qutdoor Maintenance Report Kim Rice informed the board that Larry
Brandenburg would be back on April 10™. Quotes for the cricket carpet were
presented and the board approved Challenger Turf for $2379.12 and installation
from Xtra Value Flooring for $4500.00 with a total of $6879.12, Dale Stowe
made a motion to approve the two quotes seconded by Bill Hamilton. The
motion carried unanimously.

5. Directors Report- Kim Rice requested the board to approve Kim Rice to sign a

five-year lease for a new color copier for Parks, Pavilion, and Ed Davis Learning
Center for 790.35 a month. Dale Stowe made a motion to approve the lease for



five years seconded by Sharron Flynt. The motion passed unanimously. Land
Water Grant application process is moving forward for the Marshall Park lighting.
Courtlyn Ledesma is also doing a rubber mulch grant to offset some of the cost of
the Ed Davis Park Playground, it’s a 75 to 25 match with a max of $75,000 dollars.
Kim Rice informed the board about the way we operate our current scholarship
budget and the potential to cap it when moving into the new software. Kim Rice
asked the board to approve a fake bucket of $45,000 dollars to be able to
determine the actual money we have reduced in our revenues. Dale Stowe made
a motion to establish the bucket of fake money seconded by Bill Hamilton. The
motion passed unanimously.

6) Old Business

1. Organization Sports Agreement Update- Ed Maynard informed the board in the
Agreement a resident is defined as anyone working, living, or owning property
in Scott County which clears up the question of non-resident board participation.

7) New Business

1. Archery Club- Charlie Thompson-Central KY Joad had 14 active archers which
competed in 15 Major Tournaments and 6 National Tournaments. Holding a
tournament on June 24" and 25" at Scott Co Park. The board mentioned helping
to promote Archery and get the word out in the community.

2. SFAC Concession Contract-Bryan Parker told the board that Mrs. Agruna would
like a sandwich table purchased for the concession building and the air
conditioner being fixed before she agrees to the contract. Dale Stowe made a
motion to buy the sandwich table for $1749.00 for the concession stand
seconded by Michael Johnson. The motion carried unanimously.

3. Kim Rice presented three quotes for the replacement of the HVAC in the green
room at the Pavilion, Kim Rice recommended Georgetown Advantage Air for
9200.00, and Sharon Flynt made a motion to accept Georgetown Advantage Air
seconded by Bill Hamilton. The Motion carried unanimously.

4. Kim Rice presented the quotes for the replacement of the HVAC unit at the
Brooking Park Concession building, Sharon Flynt made a motion to accept
Georgetown Advantage Air for $7950.00 seconded by Dale Stowe. The motion
Brooking passed unanimously.

5. FFA Rental Request-Seth Felts wants to use Brooking Park Concession Building for
the Chapter Banquet and was looking for a reduced or waived rate. The board
asked Kim Rice to come back to the next board meeting with a recommendation.

6. Shar Golding requested the board to consider adding the aquatic classes to the
annual membership. Mrs. Hamond spoke on behalf of her mother and herself
about participating in the aquatic classes. Dt Wells made a motion to include
aquatics fitness classes in the annual membership seconded by Michal Johnson.
Marlin McKay made a motion to also allow customers to be able to take 3 free
classes at the daily rate and then be charged accordingly seconded by Bill
Hamilton. The motion carried unanimously.

7. Marshall Park Dugouts- Josh Mauney asked the board if they would let him
rebuild the blown-down dugouts at Marshall Park with no charge to Parks and



10.

11.

12.
13.

14.

15.

Recreation. Dale Stowe made a motion to allow Josh Mauney to build the
dugouts contingent on the approval of the specs by the director seconded by
Marlin McKay. The motion carried unanimously.

Audit- Sam Waninger presented our annual fiscal year audit 2022-2023 as a
clean audit. Sam Waninger went over the audit findings with the board, after
the presentation the board discussed the term of the auditor contract. Marlin
McKay made a motion to accept the audit as presented and seconded by Dale
Stowe. The motion carried unanimously.

Employee Membership- Katie Posey wanted the board to approve employee
memberships eligible on the first day of hire. Bill Hamilton made a motion to
approve the request seconded by Dt Wells. The motion carried unanimously.
Lifeguard Rate and Aquatic hours- Bryan Parker asked the board to increase the
lifeguard starting rate to $15.00 an hour which would increase the head guard
rate to $15.50 and the management team to $16.00 an hour. Bryan Parker also
requested that the board consider reducing the operating hours of the Pavilion
pool and Suffoletta hours during the season. Dt Wells made a motion to
increase the salaries as requested, reduce the hours of operation of the Pavilion
pool, and reduce the Suffoletta twilight hours allowing Bryan Parker to decide
on one day a week for twilight hours seconded by Marlin McKay. The motion
carried unanimously. Marlin McKay requested the increased salaries take effect
on March 21% seconded by Bill Hamilton. The motion carried unanimously.
Crumb Rubber Mulch Grant-Courtlyn Ledesma asked the board to allow her to
pursue the Crumb Rubber Mulch Grant for the Ed Davis playground Dale Stowe
made the motion seconded by Dt Wells. The motion carried unanimously.

GSC FOTP Sonya Ducett Plaque- Tabled

GSC FOTP was given $10,000 in ARPA funds to build a shelter by the Pavilion
Playground, since that request the cost of building materials has increased and
the cost now will be a $20,000 project. Kim Rice informed the board that based
on our procurement process we would need to put that out to bid but $10,000
dollars would be covered by Friends of the Park.

Foster Kid Waiver Fee- Bill Hamilton spoke about the memberships and that
families that have foster kids might not meet the requirements of the pass and
suggested to the board that we waive the extra cost with the proper
documentation. Marlin McKay made a motion to allow Parks staff the authority
to add the foster kids to the annual membership outside the limits with the
proper documentation seconded by Bill Hamilton. The motion carried
unanimously.

Kim Rice handed out the budget request that will be going to the county for the
board to review. Kim Rice informed the board that a seasonal position has been
added for facility maintenance and reduced one seasonal position from the
outdoor maintenance budget. Job description update for Pavilion Manager, Ed
Davis Learning Center Manager, and the Marketing and Special Events
Recreation Manager changed the must-have bachelor’'s degree to a bachelor’s
degree in Parks and Recreation or a closely related field. Experience may be
substituted for education. DT Wells made a motion to approve the job



descriptions as presented seconded by Bill Hamilton. The motion carried
unanimously.

16. Monorail-Kim Rice mentioned that with the OSHA inspection, they pointed out
our process of lifting the pumps out of the pit and advised us that wasn’t safe,
so we have looked at getting a monorail system installed and have three quotes.
Marlin McKay made a motion to accept Combs Welding at $9510.80 seconded
by Sharon Flynt. The motion carried unanimously.

17. HVAC- SFAC Kim Rice presented the three quotes to replace the HVAC unit at
the concession stand and Dale Stowe made a motion to accept Georgetown
Advantage Air at $9900.00 seconded by Marlin McKay. The motion carried
unanimously.

18. Executive Session- Marlin McKay made a motion to go into an executive session
seconded by Sharon Flynt. The motion carried unanimously. Dale Stowe made a
motion to come out of the executive session seconded by Marlin McKay. The
motion carried unanimously. No action was taken.

19. Dt Wells made a motion based on the interlocal agreement that the director has
the authority to hire and or fire staff seconded by Marlin McKay. The motion
carried unanimously.

8) Board Member Comments
9) Adjournment — Dt Wells made a motion to adjourn seconded by Dale Stowe. The
motion carried unanimously.
10) Resolutions

Res#22-035-Approved Challenger Turf and Xtra Value Flooring to install Cricket

pitch carpet.

Restt22-036-Approved 5-year lease for a copier with American Business Systems

Res#22-037- Approved establishing a $45,000 fake bucket of scholarship/discount

Res#22-038-Approved to buy a sandwich table for the SFAC concession stand.

Res#22-039-Approved Gtown Advantage Air to replace the HVAC in the green
Room

Res#22-040-Approved Gtown Advantage Air to replace the HVAC Brooking
Concession building

Res#t22-041-Approved the water fitness classes in the annual membership.

Res#22-042-Approved 3 free class visits to new patrons to try

Restt22-043-Approved Josh Mauney to build new dugouts at Marshall Park at no
Cost

Res#22-044-Approved fiscal year 2022/23 audit

Res#22-045-Approved new employees to be eligible for an employee membership
First day of hire.

Res#22-046-Approved lifeguard starting rate at $15 and hour head guard $15.50
And management team $16.

Res#22-047-Approved reducing the operating hours of the Pavilion pool and
Reducing twilight hours at SFAC to one night during the week.

Res#22-048-Approved Courtlyn Ledesma to apply for the Crumb Rubber Mulch
Grant



Res#22-049-Approved foster kids to be waived from counting towards the eligibility
Numbers for the membership

Res#22-050-Approved changes to the Grade 9 Rec Managers job description to
Include experience may be substituted for education.

Res#22-051-Approved Combs Welding for Monorail installation for the pit.

Res#22-052-Approved Georgetown Advantage Air for the HVAC to replace HVAC at
SFAC

Res#22-053-Approved the director to be able to hire and fire staff



12:47 PM

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

04/10/23
Paid Bills Detail
As of April 10, 2023
Date Memo _ Account Debit Credit
Amazon .
ow\wtmomww ”Nooo - Accounts Payable 1,449.00
om\w:momw.m_ub,o Refrigerated Sandwich Table 5500 - Concession Supplies and Equipme 1,449.00
ow\wimomm_ 12000 - Accounts Payable 79.81
ow\w\_\mowwmo?mqmmm Wall Calendar for Katie 4270 - Office Supplies and Equipment 79.81
om\wimommu 12000 - Accounts Payable 244 .38
03/31/2023 Pool Reagents for Pavilion wmof - Pavilion - Aquatics Supplies 122.19
03/31/2023 Poal Reagents for SFAC 15140 - SFAC Pool Supplies/Chemicals 122.19
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable . 45.88
ow\wimomwﬂm‘m_:mh_a;n Acid for SFAC 15140 SFAC Pool Supplies/Chemicals 22.94
o W 03/31/2023 Pool Sulfuric Acid for Pavilion 8094 - Pavilion - Aquatics Supplies " 2294
03/31/2023 ”mooo - Accounts Payable 127.69
03/31/2023 Ink for Helen's Printer/Tab Dividers for Office 4270 - Office Supplies and Equipment 127.69
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 28.97
om\w\:momm.IU_s_ Cable for Director/ Post-It Notes 4270 - Office Supplies and Equipment 28.97
Total Amazon 1,975.73 1,975.73
American mcmm:tmwm Systems Inc.
ow\mimomw. 2000 - Accounts Payable 790.35
03/31/2023 Pavilion Copier Usage Fees .Amﬂo - Office Supplies and Equipment 75.85
03/31/2023 Ed Davis Copier Usage Fees 9230 - ED - Office Supplies ﬂm.mm.
ow\wimcwu. Parks Copier Usage Fees 4270 - Office Supplies and Equipment 638.65
Total American Business Systems Inc. . 790.35 790.35
Bluegrass RV Storage M
ow\wimomm. 2000 - Accounts Payable 1,740.00
ow\u:momu@_oxa Dance Storage Unit Yearly Fee 8085 - Pavilion - Dance/Gymnastics Supplies 1,020.00
om\w:momw;oﬁo Parks Storage Unit Yearly Fee 4270 - Office Supplies and Equipment 720.00
Total Bluegrass RV Storage . 1,740.00 1,740.00
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12:47 PM
04/10/23

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Paid Bills Detail

As of April 10, 2023

Date Memo Account Debit Credit
Brandstetter Carroll, Inc.
ow\wimomu. 2000 - Accounts Payable . 1,250.00
03/31/2023 Comprehensive Master Plan Installment (11/22) 4880 - Capital Expenditures 1,250.00
Total Brandstetter Carroll, inc. . w fmmo.oo. 1,250.00
W
Charter Communications . . _
. ow\w:momw. .mooo Accounts Payable | 139.98
_ 03/31/2023 Internet/ Cable for SFAC 200 Airport Rd. 5060 - SFAC Center Phone 139.98
, 03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable | 264.25
03/31/2023 Internet/Cable For EDLC 151 Ed Davis Lane 9315 : ED Internet Service/Cable 264.25|
ow\mtmowwu 2000 - Accounts Payable . 129.99
om\wimomw._:”mﬂ:mqom&_m for mu\oaommm_o: Bldg. 100 _um:mﬂocsam WO. .Am;o - Supplies 129.99
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable . 139.98
- ow\w‘_\momw::ﬁm.ﬁmqog_m for Outdoor Main. Bidg. 4600 - Scott County Park 139.98
. ow\w‘_\momwu 2000 - Accounts Payable . 520.00
03/31/2023 Internet/Cable for Pavilion 140 Pavilion Dr. 8074 - Pavilion - Supp., Serv., Repair 499.20
03/31/2023 Admin 4% Parks Internet/Cable 140 Pavilion Dr. .mo§ - Pavition - m:uv..lwm?. Repair 20.80
Total Charter Communications 1,194.20 1,194.20
Columbia Gas of Kentucky
ow\uimomu. - 2000 - Accounts Payable . 282.76
L ow\uimomw_ 146 Ed Davis Ln. Gas Usage Fees .mwj * ED - Columbia Gas 282.76!
om\wimomw. o 12000 - Accounts Payable . 325.85
03/31/2023 1240 Cincinnati Rd/Outdoor Main. Bldg. 4600 - Scott County Park 325.85
1ow\wtmomw .Nooo - Accounts Payable | w.mﬂm.m
03/31/2023 140 Pavilion Way 8066 - Pavilion - Columbia Gas 3,717.38
03/31/2023 Admin 4% Usage 8066 - Pavilion - Columbia Gas 154.89
Total Columbia Gas of _Amzz._.o_é | 4,480.88 4,480.88
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04/10/23

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Paid Bills Detail
As of April 10, 2023

Date Memo 7 Account Debit _ Credit
Georgetown Municipal Water

ow\w:momw. 2000 - Accounts Payable . 40.63
03/31/2023 200 Jacobs Dr./ SFAC 5050 - SFAC Georgetown Water 40.63

ow\w\_\momw. 2000 - Accounts Payable | 32.71
03/31/2023 162-165 onmm_m|:m Dr./Batting Cage 4510 - Suffoletta Park 32.71

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 25.23
03/31/2023 Louie B Nunn Dr./ Field #1 14510 * Suffoletta Park 25.23

03/31/2023! 2000 - Accounts Payable 17.23
03/31/2023 162-165 Scroggins Dr./ Fields #2 & #4 14510 - Suffoletta Park 17.23

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 17.23
03/31/2023 Louie B Nunn Dr./ Field #3 4510 - Suffoletta Park 17.23

03/31/2023 ) 12000 - Accounts Payable | 30.78
ow\wimomwu 162-165 Scroggins Dr./Picnic Shelter Whméo - Suffoletta Park 30.78|

03/31/2023 12000 - Accounts Payable 30.78
03/31/2023 Louie B Nunn Dr./Concession Stand 14510 - Suffoletta Park _ 30.78 -
ow\wimomu. 2000 - Accounts Payable _ 16.26
03/31/2023 Horseshoe Pit 14510 Suffoletta Park 16.26

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 17.23
03/31/2023 Royal Spring Park .Ammo Royal Spring Park i 17.23

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 17.23
03/31/2023 S Water Street Park 4650 - Royal Spring Park 17.23

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable . 16.25
om\mk_\momwmmooz County Park 48600 - Scott County Park 16.25

ow\wtmomwm 12000 - Accounts Payable | 110.95
03/31/2023 151 Ed Davis Lane wmw:u - ED - Georgetown Water 110.95

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 25.23
03/31/2023 145 Ed Davis Lane a 4540 - Ed Davis _ummx ) 25.23|

03/31/2023 12000 - Accounts Payable 380.09
ow\uimomm. 1260 Cincinnati Pike (Water Leak) o 14600 - Scott County Park 380.09

03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 4,272.83
ow\w.:momw. 140 Pavilion Dr. o .mouo - Pavilion - Georgetown Water 4,230.10

03/31/2023 1% Parks Administrative 8070 - Pavilion - Georgetown Water ] 42.73
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12:47 PM
04/10/23

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Paid Bills Detail
As of April 10, 2023

- Date Memo v, Account Debit Credit
om\mimomu. ,Nooo - Accounts Payable 17.23
03/31/2023 0 Long Lick Entrance .Amoo - Scott County Park 17.23
_ ow\w‘_\momww 2000 - Accounts Payable 38.80
ow\wtmomm_,_,\_ma:m__ Park Dr. (4570 - Marshall Park 38.80
03/31/2023, 2000 - Accounts Payable | 30.78
owGiwomw?mpo Cincinnati Pike 4600 - Scott County Park 30.78
ow\uiwomwM 2000 - Accounts Payable 213.56
03/31/2023 140 Pavilion Dr./ Upstairs & Skate Park B 8070 - Pavilion - Georgetown Water 211.42
03/31/2023 1% Parks Administrative Usage - .mowo - Pavilion - Georgetown Water 214
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 32.63
ou\mimomw.moo Jacobs Dr./ Parks & Rec 4570 - Marshall Park 32.63
Total Georgetown Municipal Water . . 5,383.66 5,383.66
Emmqm Financial !
03/31/2023 {2000 - Accounts Payable 32.99
03/31/2023 Flag for Flag Pole @ Pavilion 8074 - Pavilion - Supp., Serv., Repair 32.99
Total John Deere Financial . 32.99 32.99
Kentucky Utilities Company |
03/31/2023 2000 * Accounts Payable 1,150.82
03/31/2023 NA Louie B Nunn Batting Cage 4810 - Supplies _1,150.82 -
03/31/2023 ] 2000 - Accounts Payable 77.37
03/31/2023{NA Louie B Nunn Dr. Ball/ Suff Park L 4510 - Suffoletta Park 77.37
ow\uimom& 2000 - Accounts Payable 156.09
- ow\m._\momw,z», Louie B Nunn Dr./ Suff _um%ll 4510 - Suffoletta Park 156.09
ou\m:momw. ,2000 - Accounts Payable | 43.84
N 03/31/2023 NA Markham Dr./ Suff Park 4510 - Suffoletta Park Am.mau
03/31/2023 .mooo Accounts Payable . 322.16
03/31/2023 NA Louie B Nunn Dr. Ball/ Suff Park ”Am‘_o Suffoletta Park 322.16
03/31/2023 12000 - Accounts Payable . 103.33
03/31/2023 1965 Oxford Dr./Oxford Park 14630 - Oxford Road Park ,_ow,w&
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 1,263.15

Page 4 of 6



12:47 PM
04/10/23

Paid Bills Detail
As of April 10, 2023

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Date Memo _ Account Debit Credit
ow\wimowu.f,\_ma:m__ Park Dr. PI. .AmHo - Marshall Park fmmw.‘_m.
! ow\m‘_\momm” 12000 - Accounts Payable 10,018.05
03/31/2023 140 Pavilion Dr. /8068 - Pavilion - Kentucky Utilities 9,617.33
03/31/2023 140 Pavilion Dr. Admin 4% 8068 - Pavilion - Kentucky Ultilities 400.72
03/31/2023 ”mooo - Accounts Payable 296.75
03/31/2023 201 Airport Rd. Concession Stand 4570 - Marshall Park mom.ﬂm.
03/31/2023 12000 - Accounts Payable 411.39
03/31/2023 200 Airport Rd. Aquatic wmomo 411.39]
03/31/2023 — 2000 - Accounts Payable \ | 56.78
03/31/2023 201 Airport Rd Field #5 4570 - Marshall Park M 56.78
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable _ . 203.66
03/31/2023 NA Airport Rd. Field #3 4570 - Marshall Park 203.66
03/31/2023 ) ‘ 12000 - Accounts Payable 45.40
03/31/2023 Na Airport Rd. Field #2 |4570 - Marshall Park 45.40 |
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable 129.35
03/31/2023,201 Airport Rd. Conc. 4570 - Marshall Park 129.35
03/31/2023 2000 - Accounts Payable A@
i 03/31/2023 1080 Cincinnati Rd. Balifield B 4600 - Scott County Park 163.40
03/31/2023 N - 2000 - Accounts Payable | 40.51
ow\uimomw.mmm Liste Rd Soccer Gate 4810 - Supplies 40.51
03/31/2023 Wmooo - Accounts Payable . 191.68
03/31/2023 201 Airport Rd./ Field #4 4570 - Marshall Park Af.mm.
Total Kentucky Utilities Company . E_mww.w.wﬁ 14,673.73
Em!.:n.
03/31/2023 2000 * Accounts Payable | 961.07
03/31/2023 Pavilion/Parks Office Phones Usage Fees 4240 - Office Phone mwm.aw.
. ow\wtmommwm_ﬁo Office Phones Usage Fees 15060 - SFAC Center Phone 64.32
, ow\w‘_\mowwﬂma Davis Office Phones Usage Fees 9310 - ED - Telephone 200.00
03/31/2023 Outdoor Main. Bldg. Office Phone Usage Fees .Amoo - Scott County Park 64.32
Total Nextiva Inc. . o 961.07 961.07

Page 5 of 6



12:47PM
04/10/23

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Paid Bills Detail
As of April 10, 2023

Date Memo Account Debit Credit
! |
Pagesuite Inc
ow\mimomw. ”Nooo - Accounts Payable | 210.00
om\w‘_\momwﬁ:::m_ Digital Publication License Fee 2023 .Awoo - Advertising, Print., Marketing - 210.00 i
Total Pagesuite Inc | | | - 21000 210.00
_Jmmu:czo Services Inc.
ow\w‘_\momw. 2000 - Accounts Payable 2,129.63
- ow\m‘_\momw.m_ums_mo: Trash Removal Services 8074 - Pavilion - Supp., Serv., Repair 364.44
ow\w._\momwwm_ub,o Trash mm3ﬂ<m_ Services 8074 ' Pavilion - Supp., Serv., Repair 343.59
ow\m:momm.ocaooﬂ Maintenance Trash Removal Services .moE - Pavilion - Supp., Serv., Repair 1,421.60
Total Republic Services inc. B . 2,129.63 2,129.63
Verizon Wireless
ow\w._\momm. .mooo - Accounts Payable 937.84
om\wimomw. Pavilion Administration Cell Phone Fees .Awmo Cell phones mhm.mow
03/31/2023 Outdoor Main. Cell Phone Fees 4750 - Cell phones _ mmm.a_
03/31/2023 Facility Maintenance Cell Phone Fees 4750 - Cell phones ‘_ww.ﬁ;
ow\uimoww. Pavilion Rec Mgr. Cell Phone Fees 4750 - Cell phones hw.um.
i ow\uimomm. Ed Davis Mgr. Cell Phone Fees .ﬁmo - Cell phones Aw.wm.
m 03/31/2023 Aquatics Cell Phone Fees .ﬁmo Cell phones 98.72
Total Verizon Wireless < 937.84 937.84
Wal-Mart
ow\wtmomw. 2000 - Accounts Payable 159.35
B ow\wimomw” Plastic Eggs for Paws in The Park Event 6850 - New Prog/Sp Events Supplies 84.69
ow\w:momwno_‘_:xm for Board Meeting .mmmo + Miscellaneous - mw.mm”
03/31/2023 EDLC BHM Children's Program Sugpplies 9400 - ED-Prog., Event, Supplies&Equip 50.78
Total Wal-Mart . \_mo.wi 159.35
Totals: 35,919.43  35,919.43
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March 2023 Program Report
For April 17, 2023 GSC Parks & Recreation Board Meeting
Ednal Maynard

Pavilion Operations

Pavilion Program Attendance: 3,026

Pavilion Annual Membership: 3,998

Pavilion Daily Passes: 8,038

Fiscal Year To Date Attendance: 105,672

Total Pavilion Attendance Including Programs, Passes, Non-Participants, and Rentals: 17,053
Pavilion Operations Income: $130,063.35

Pavilion Expenses: $52,373.63

Pavilion Recovery Rate: 248%

Ed Davis Learning Center
EDLC Attendance Including Daily Attendance, Programs, Community Services, and Rentals: 305

Daily Attendance: 195
Meetings: 20
Rentals: 20
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Attendance Type 2019 2020 2021 2022 2023
20 Visit—Pass - - 3_37 123 219 —EI 332
20 Visit Walker Pass 394 94
6 Month Pass 643 111 283 458 232
Annual Pass 4320 1259 1684 2432 3998
Complimentary Pass 33 19 26 79
Daily Pass 3930 759 3960 4795 8038
Observer Attendance 663 345 350 775 743
Off-Site Program Attendance 12
Program Attendance 3580 1435 2006 2539 3026
Rental / Meeting Attendance 787 282 657 450 605
14699 4408 9178 11726 17053



e .
S 2018 - to Date Fiscal Year
pagedreeentin  Attendance Comparison

AttendanceType 2018-19 2019-20 2020-21 2021-22 2022-23
Daily Pass 34959 20418 26341 42156 37638
Complimentary Pass 564 338 249 294 330
20 Visit Pass 3145 2218 2414 2450 2317
6 Month Pass 5558 3213 2320 4018 1892
20 Visit Walker Pass 2880 1973 191 208

Rental / Meeting Attendance 5533 5706 2401 6690 6332
Annual Pass 46454 30733 19202 25103 30748
Program Attendance 42868 29062 19961 25271 21855

Coupon Pass
Off-Site Program Attendance 231 10

Observer Attendance 7763 5031 1995 4094 4560

149955 98702 75074 110284 105672
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2:30 PM
04117123
Accrual Basis

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Financial Statement

March 2023
Income
Accounts Income March 2023 YTD Income Budget Balance % of Budget

3030 - City Funds 0.00 970,449.34 1,255,000.00 -284,550.66 77.33%
3060 - County Funds 0.00 941,250.00 1,255,000.00 .wahmo.ooﬁlll 75.0%
3150 - Pool Income 0.00 mﬂ;mm.mﬂ 258,000.00 -170,837.34 33.78%
3180 - Horse Park Pool 0.00 41,044.50, 57,700.00 -16,655.50 71.13%
3260 - Pool Concessions- Contract 0.00 f»mw.ﬁm m_a -w.m\_m.mw‘ - 29.74%
3400 - Kidzworld Income 74,536.25 mmx.mmm.wm 105,000.00 _-22/434.75 78.63%
3430 - Fun Express Income ftl|§. 7,345.00 10,000.00 -2,655.00 73.45%
3470 - KLC wmmm@ Grant 0.00 0.00 3,000.00 -3,000.00 0.0%
3600 - Facility Rental Income 10,973.00 29,180.25 ¢ wmumoobwm _ -1,319.75 79.95%
3710 - Special Events Income , 0.00 4‘_‘_3.00 mo&oo -3,883.00 22.34%
3720 - Private Donations 0.00, Is‘xlm.oo 2,500.00 -2,494.00: 0.24%
3730 - New Programs Income R 0.00' 2,000.00 5,000.00 -w_ooo.oo_i 40.0%
3750 - Miscellaneous Income 4o[mo 0.00 300.00 -300.00 0.0%
8014 - Pavilion - 20 V Passes mmRN&m«olM 20,007.20 . 30,000.00 -9,992.80 66.69%
8015 - Pavilion - Daily Passes 24,887.00 Gw_amw | 164,000.00 -10,487.04 93.61%
8016 - Pavilion - Annual Pass - ;!mm\mMﬂmM 233,142.43; mmo‘_@.or 13,142.43 105.97%
8017 - Pavilion - 6 Month Pass 484.00 11,302.81 mm_.ooo.oo _ -10697.19 51.38%
.modm . _ums:o.m,.Wc:m:nm _u_.om._.m_:m 4,222 65 21 ,‘So.wmw 50,000.00 -mm_omwh‘ 42.02%
8020 - _um,s_mo_.. Gymnasium Programs 1,675.00 G.,moo.ﬁ mo_ooo.oow o -4,499.86 77.5%
8022 - Pavilion - Dance/Gymnastics Pro 560,00 92,928.96 114,000.00 21,071.04 81.52%
8024 - Pavilion - Aerobics _u_.om_.xm-sm 924.00 8,150.00 15,000.00 -mbmo.co” 54.33%
8026 - Pavilion - Camps/Childrens Act. 0.00 0.00 3,000.00 -3,000.00 0.0%
8028 - Pavilion - Special Events 0.00 403.36 - 5,000.00 B -4,596.64 8.07%
8030 - Pavilion - Child Care 35.00 220.00 350.00 o -130.00 62.86%
8032 - Pavilion - Facility Rental 3,380.00; 27,226.00 45,000.00 -17,774.00 60.5%
8034 - Pavilion - Concession/Vending wmo.ﬂm_ lscﬂmMme ] 10,000.00 -2,639.97 73.6%
8035 - Gift Certificates 0.00 l||mwm.oo_ 0.00 335.00 100.0%
8036 - Pavilion - Miscellaneous 5.00 56.00 j 500.00 -444.00 11.2%

Total Income 156,751.26 2,754,762.41 3,696,850.00 -942,087.59, 74.52%
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2:30 PM
04/17/23
Accrual Basis

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation

Financial Statement

March 2023
Expense
Accounts Expense March 2023 YTD Expense Budget Balance % of Budget
4030 - ADMINISTRATIVE SALARIES - FT 25,076.38 162,348.37 300,000.00 137,651.63 54.12%
4060 - Employer FICA Tax  13go008 87,057.91 130,000.00 42,042.09 67.66%
4090 - Unemployment Insurance O 45235 195858 17.500.00 15,541.42 11.19%
4120 - Workers Compensation 2,432.75 41,061.73 59,000.00 _17,938.27 69.6%
4130 ; .U_.:m Testing 350.00 2,170.00 5,000.00 2,830.00 43.4%
4150 - Employers Retirement 17,278.34 17886486 218,000.00 39,135.14 82.05%
4180 - Health Insurance ) ‘\;\lﬂw.‘mwm.wm 205,084.01 ~290,000.00 84,915.99 70.72%
4200 - Staff Uniforms oo 000, 3,000.00 3,000.00 0.0%
4201 - REC. MANAGERS SALARIES - FT 10,878.00 mm,mmp.mﬁ 153,000.00 _ 87,005.46 43.13%
4202 - PAV. OPERATIONS SALARIES - PT ||Im’m_mom.ﬁ ‘_mm_www;ow - 185,400.00 32,466.90 82.49%
4240 - Office Phone 632.43 5,502.39 ~ 1,800.00: -3,702.39 305.69%
4260 - Equipment rental . 0.00 0.00 o M:ooo.ooW 4,000.00 0.0%
4270 - Office Supplies and mn:mvm_wmmﬁi 7,461.78) 67,258.67 46,000.00 -21,258.67 146.22%
a~|mo * Professional Fees ] |ﬂﬁﬂy 24.079.16 25,000.00 wm@“ 96.32%
4300 - Advertising, Print., Marketing 8105 19,276.65 25,000.00 5,723.35! 77.11%
4320 - Technology Support B 556051 m womem 40,000.00 . -17,078.88 142.7%
4360 - Continuing Education 0.00 3,930.79 11,000.00 N “ﬁomo.mé 35.73%
4370 - Liability, Equipment Insurance 0.00 78,251.51 94,000.00 1574849 83.25%
4390 - Travel mxmm.,..mm !mnOaOL_'! 1,344.04 ﬂ“ooo.oo m.@w}m 19.2%
4450 - PARKS MAINT. SALARIES - FT No.m:m.aw..l 137,658.90 258,000.00 120,341.10 53.36%
4460 - PARKS MAINT. HOURLY - PT , 0.00 7,198.26, ) 80,000.00 72,801.74 9.0%
4470 - FACILITY MAINT. SALARIES - PT | 8,045.69 mmumm‘_im.i ‘ - 70,000.00 m‘l; 19,778.43 71.75%
4480 - FACILITY MAINT. SALARIES - FT E_.‘_mu.oo @u_wm\.\}.‘wﬂml 190,000.00 96,772.03; 49.07%
4490 - 4490 - FAC. MAINT. SALARY - FT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
4509 - Trail Maintenance 0.00 0.00 5,000.00 _5,000.00 0.0%
4510 - Suffoletta Park 834.43 9,998.74 12,500.00 2,501.26 79.99%
4520 - Skate Park 0.00 |!]1o|mm w.ooo.oo 5,000.00 0.0%
4540 - Ed Davis Park 286.09 2,890.97 6,000.00 3,108.03 48.18%
4570 - Marshall Park 2,407.25 21,655.83 ) 16,000.00 -5,655.83 135.35%
4600 - Scott County Park 1,678.56 27,350.64 1300000 -14,350.64 210.39%
4610 - Oser Landing Park Aﬂwlhm_ fwmm.bmm 5,000.00 3,203.52 35.93%

Page 2 of 4



2:30 PM
04/17/23
Accrual Basis

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation
Financial Statement

March 2023
Accounts Expense March 2023 YTD Expense Budget Balance % of Budget
4630 - Oxford Road Park 103.33 938.16 2,000.00 _1,061.84 46.91%
4640 - Great Crossing Park 0.00 0.00 12,500.00 12,500.00, 0.0%
4650 - Royal Spring Park 34.46 255.48 5,500.00 ‘m_mﬁ.mwm 4.65%
4660 - Vehicle Maintenance and Parts 0.00 m_mmﬂ 12,500.00 lm_mom.th 79.12%
Ammo . mn%_:m:» z_mm:nmmm\:nm and Parts uwm.am‘ ti!w.\:m‘ow Bua ] |m.mma.wﬂ 57.04%
4750 - Cell phones omw.mm 8,489.91 12,000.00 3,510.09 70.75%
4780 - Fuel and Qil 2,044.50 mm_mwm.mo% - 33,000.00 7,364.40 77.68%
4810 - Supplies - - 19,846.72 mmﬂmﬁmMWi[- 78,000.00 -7,548.29 109.68%
4850 - Parks Equipment 0.00 0.00, 3,500.00 3,500.00 0.0%
4930 - SUFFOLETTA POOL SALARIES 0.00 mmbam.w&‘\ 107,200.00 ~ 41,151.80 61.61%
5000 - HORSE PARK LG HOURY 0.00 23,730.71 ww@g - 9,769.29 70.84%
5020 - SFAC Kentucky Utilities 411.39 33,365.53 35,000.00' 1,634.47 95.33%
5050 - SFAC Georgetown Water Ao.oﬂ 15,049.61 o Nﬂooo.o& 11,850.39, 55.74%
5060 - SFAC Center Phone 20430 2,892.79 3,700.00 807.21| 78.18%
5140 - SFAC Pool Supplies/Chemicals 905.1 & 17537500 33,000.00 15,462.50, 53.14%
5200 - SFAC Pool Supplies/Maintenance 15,957.32 26,047.12 ~21,000.00 -5,047.12 124.03%
6280 -Litls Loague Basoball e T e o
6330 - Archery o Y ™ Y 500.00 00%
6340 - Youth Softball ‘ 0.00° 537.50 500.00 -37.50 107.5%
6370 - Youth Soccer 0.00: 0.00 500.00 500.00 0.0%
6400 - Youth Football -mm.mo; - -202.50, 50000 702.50 -40.5%
6420 - Youth Volleyball 0.00 ) 0.00, 250.00 o 250.00 0.0%
6430 - Georgetown Stingrays 0.00 0.00 250.00 250.00 0.0%
6440 - Super Sharks N 0.00 - o000 0.00 000 0.0%
6460 - KIDZWORLD SALARIES 0.00 - ‘hmwﬂmww ~98,000.00 mm_mmeo\_; 43.24%
6490 - Kidzworld Supplies 0.00 6,304.19 15,000.00 -1,304.19 126.08%
6500 - Kidzworld-Transportation 0.00 ilw‘.“_wm.wm ‘ 22,000.00 14,821.62 32.63%
6520 - Kidzworld Lunch Program - 0.00 - 993.97 ‘ 600.00 -393.97 165.66%
6550 - Fun Express Supplies 66.00 .I:iﬁ.oJM!,.ll 1,000.00 B 383.96 61.6%
6551 - FUN EXPRESS m>_|>_u_mw.; 0.00 m_ww@.mo‘, Am_ooo.oo. 9,760.50 18.66%
6700 - SPORTS CAMPS SALARIES PT 0.00 o |m%u 500.00 500.00 0.0%
6720 - Sports Camps Supplies o.oow omm 500.00 500.00 0.0%
6840 - NEW PROG/SPEC EVENTS SAL PT . o.oo_ imm.mmm 5,000.00! 3,871.14; 22.58%

Page 3 of 4



2:30 PM
04/17123
Accrual Basis

Georgetown-Scott County Parks and Recreation
Financial Statement

March 2023
Accounts Expense March 2023 YTD Expense Budget Balance % of Budget

6850 - New Prog/Sp Events Supplies 1,482.97 5,639.55 1,500.00 -4,139.55 375.97%
6880 - Miscellaneous 23.88 573.39 800.00 226.61 71.67%
8066 - Pavilion - Columbia Gas - wumﬂm.ml 35,861.20 53,00000 17,138.80 67.66%
8068 - Pavilion - Kentucky Utilities SbAm.om, 103,429.06 140,000.00 36,570.94 73.88%
8070 - Pavilion - Georgetown Water A.‘Amm.wm 33,231.10 60,000.00 26,768.90, 55.39%
8074 - Pavilion - Supp., Serv,, Repair 8,633.75 121,460.02 200,000.00 .@E‘“ 60.73%
8076 - Pavilion - Equipment o 0.00 49.99 12,000.00 11,950.01 0.42%
8080 - PAVILION - GYM PROGRAM SALARIES 171.38 1,301.50 m._ooo.oo 6,698.50 16.27%
8081 - Pavilion - Gym Program Supplies o 58.42 fomm.hmw 2,000.00 S 943.55 52.82%
8082 - PAVILION - AEROBICS SALARIES 3,725.48 21 .mmw.Km 61,800.00 39,846.86 35.52%
8083 - Pavilion - Aerobics Supplies 0.00 125.92 2,000.00 1,874.08 6.3%
8084 - PAVILION - DANCE/GYM SALARIES umoufmo 32,601.61 mmha.ﬁ - 22,398.39 59.28%
8085 - Pavilion - Dance/Gym mcum_mmm !ﬂ_ﬂom.om Kbmmmm 8,500.00° -5,5649.29 165.29%
8088 - PAVILION - SPECIAL EVENTS SALAR ‘ 0.00 0.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 0.0%
8089 - Pavilion - Special Events Suppl 35.00 173270 125000 -482.70. 138.62%
8090 - Pavilion - Concession 0.00! ,, ooo o 0.00 0.00 0.0%
8092 - PAVILION - AQUATICS SALARIES PT o mobmw.mu‘ﬂ 142,964:12 210,000.00 67,035.88 68.08%
8094 - Pavilion - Aquatics Supplies o;mﬂﬁ.ﬂ 38,353.83 20,000.00 -18,353.83 191.77%
8098 - Pavilion - Child Care Supplies . mmu o 68.04 o 500.00 431.96 13.61%
8100 - Pavilion - Fitness/Wgt _m-: am:v[vm 0.00 w_amm.oi 2,500.00 -962.07 138.48%
8102 - Pavilion - Gymnasium Supplies 0.00 187.52] 1,000.00 812.48 18.75%
W.o'a. Pavilion - Miscellaneous Expens 0.00 0.00 800.00 800.00 0.0%

Total Expense 302,397.07 2,449,214.46 3,696,850.00 1,247,635.54| 66.25%
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Brenntag

Product Name

2023
Packaging

Quote

uom

Hydrochloric Acid 20 DEG 31.45% 145.00004-PDRM|  $505 | G
Amazon
|Product Name Packaging 2023 _co_s
Quote
Cyanuric Acid {Cl Stabalizer SFAC ONLY) 25.0000# BAG $130.00 EACH Calcium Chloride Xtra 83-87% 50.0000 # BAG NA EACH
Sequa-SOL 1GL No Bid EACH Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% 1.0000 G BULK NA GAL
Cover Free 1qt No Bid EACH Hydrochloric Acid 20 DEG 31.45% 145.0000 # -PDRM NA GAL
Sodium Thiosulfate Penta Photo 50.0000 # BAG NA EACH
SwimPro Sodium Bicarbonate Industrial 50.0000 # BAG NA EACH
PraN e Pactaging 2023 UOM Sada Ash Dense 50.0000 # BAG NA EACH
Quote Cyanuric Acid (Cl Stabalizer SFAC ONLY) 25.0000# BAG NA EACH
Calcium Chloride Xtra 83-87% 50.0000 # BAG No Bid EACH

Sequa-SOL

16L $98.91

Hydrochloric Acid 20 DEG 31.45% 145.0000 # -PDRM No Bid GAL
Sodium Thiosulfate Penta Photo 50.0000 # BAG No Bid EACH
Sodium Bicarbonate Industrial 50.0000 # BAG No Bid EACH
Sada Ash Dense 50.0000 # BAG No Bid EACH

EACH

Cover Free

lqt No Bid

EACH

Recomandations are highlighted in Green.
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GEORGETOWN-SCOTT COUNTY
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MARKETING
REPORT 2023

GEORGETOWN SCOTT
COUNTY PARKS AND
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GSC PARKS AND
RECREATION
MARKETING - QI 2023

Website

15,829 Users
Increase of 62% from Q4 2022
Increase of 8% from Q1 2022
* Pages
45,656 Pages Visited
Increase 75% from Q4 2022
Decrease of 1% from QI 2022
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GRANTS AWARDED

/\ LWCEF Ed Davis Playground

7 $500,000

& Status: Awarded



MOVING FORWARD
CHILDREN'S PROGRAM

EVENTS PAWS IN THE PARK EASTER EGG HUNT
ED DAVIS LEARNING CENTER EASTER EGG HUNT




CHILDREN'’S
PROGRAM

*  PARTICIPANTS: 60
= SPONSORS

= SCOTT COUNTY PUBLIC
LIBRARY

* GEORGETOWN COLLEGE
* GEORGETOWN NAACP

= TRUTH RECORDING AND
ENTERTAINMENT




ED DAVIS LEARNING CENTER EASTER EGG
HUNT

PARTICIPANTS: 280

SPONSORS:
GEORGETOWN POLICE DEPARTMENT
SCOTT COUNTY SHERIFF'S DEPARTMENT

SAINT PAUL LODGE #1 | — PRINCE HALL FREE AND ACCEPTED
MASONS OF KENTUCKY

QUEEN VASHTI #37 — CRDER OF THE EASTERN STAR




UPCOMING EVENTS

1 >_u2_ 20,2023 SeniorWorld Keeneland Trip @ Keeneland

_(_mvs 6,2023 Bike Safety Event (@ The Pavilion | 10:00am

EDLC Resource & Career Fair @ Ed Davis
_/\_Nv\ 13,2023 Learning Center | | 1:00am
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Dashboard /[ Ggorggtgwnlgggtt County Parks & Recredtion Claims Report
| Georgetown/Scott County Parks & Recreation Claims Report Activity

Georgetown/Scott County Parks & Recreation Claims Report Activity

Claim Type = All, Dates = 01/01/2022 - 12/31/2022, Status = All

Claim Number Type Dot Status Closed Date Reserve Paid Collection Incurred
724434 General Liability 10/29/2022 Open $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00  $5,000.00
723476 Medical Only 07/25/2022 Closed 10/17/2022 $0.00  $1467.68 $0.00  $1,467.68
723454 Lost Time 07/20/2022 Open $3109.75  $2,047.75 $0.00  $5,157.50
723012 Report Only 06/01/2022 Closed 07/11/2022 $0.00 $157.50 $0.00 $157.50
722535 Blanket Property Loss  03/30/2022 Closed 05/09/2022 $0.00 $55,280.00 $0.00 $55,280.00
722440 Report Only 03/18/2022 Closed 06/23/2022 $0.00 $150.00 $0.00 $150.00
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